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 Would Taxing Banks Really 
Make the Banking System 
Safer?

by David VanHoose

I
n the wake of the 2007–09 banking crisis, 
some economists recommended imposing 
new taxes on banks. These proponents con-
tend that policy makers could apply the taxes 
to correct “negative externalities,” or adverse 

spillover effects onto overall welfare, allegedly cre-
ated by individual banks. Spillovers are assumed to 
arise from individually optimal bank decisions that 
fail to account for the higher risks that the aggrega-
tion of those choices might create for the banking sys-
tem as a whole. Taxing banks is supposed to nudge 
the banks to restrain operations that contribute to 
total societal risks. 

It is unfortunate that these bank tax proposals fail to 
consider the unintended side effects of such taxes on 
the compositions of banks’ assets and liabilities. Even 
if taxes succeeded in inducing banks to restrain truly 
spillover-contributing operations, the resulting reshuf-
fl ings of assets and liabilities would likely yield a riskier 
post-tax aggregate level of bank lending. Specifi cally, 
banks that already had been expending resources to 
screen and monitor loans would have strong incentives 
to respond to the tax either by cutting back on the high-
quality loans that they had been making or by reducing 
their expenses by subjecting loans that they continue to 
make to less screening and monitoring. Such responses 
would undermine the intended benefi ts of imposing 
these taxes.

ALLEGED BANKING EXTERNALITIES AND HOW 
TAXES MIGHT CORRECT THEM

Allegedly, banking externalities can arise either 
in bank liability markets, such as markets for deposits 
or interbank borrowings, or in bank asset markets, such 
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as markets for loans or securities. For instance, some 
economists have argued that spillovers in interbank 
borrowing markets can occur when any given bank that 
extends a loan to another institution takes into account 
only the risks of repayment delays or defaults on the 
part of that single institution. The borrowing institution 
could, in turn, use the funds to extend higher-interest 
loans to other institutions that make even riskier loans. 
Thus, the loan from the original bank could contribute 
to greater overall risks than that bank takes into consid-
eration. Proponents of bank taxes suggest that apply-
ing an appropriately calibrated tax rate to all interbank 
borrowings would induce banks to lend the socially 
optimal amount, thereby eliminating the potential for 
excessive borrowing across the banking system.1

Tax proponents further contend that banks extend too 
many private sector loans, pointing to the upsurge in 
real estate lending between 1982 and 2006, shown in 
Figure 1. They say that this upsurge resulted in part 
from the failures of individual banks to recognize that 
as each bank boosted its real-estate lending, the result-
ing rise in aggregate lending reduced the pool of resid-
ual borrowers who were creditworthy. As all banks 
sought higher profi ts from boosting real estate lend-
ing, the pool of creditworthy borrowers was dissipated, 
which broadened exposure of the banking system to 

loan losses. Imposing an appropriate uniform tax rate 
on each additional dollar of real-estate credit, tax pro-
ponents suggest, would have nudged banks to reduce 
their overall lending and thereby prevented aggregate 
overlending from occurring.2

AN OVERLOOKED COMPLICATION: ALTERED 
ASSET AND LIABILITY COMPOSITIONS 

Analysis of the logic of bank tax proposals reveals a 
complication that its proponents overlook: unintended 
adverse effects on banks’ efforts to contain loan losses.3 
Roughly half of a typical bank’s operating costs arise 
from expenses on labor and capital. For banks that take 
seriously efforts to restrain exposures to loan losses, 
signifi cant portions of labor and capital resources are 
dedicated to screening loan applicants to determine 
which are creditworthy and to monitoring borrowers 
in an effort to prevent unproductive squandering of loan 
proceeds. Furthermore, as banks add labor and other 
variable inputs to fi xed factors, such as equipment and 
facilities to screen and monitor additional lending, their 
per-unit expenses tend to rise. Just as any other fi rm 
seeking to produce a high-quality product faces increas-
ing marginal cost of producing additional units, a bank’s 
marginal cost of screening and monitoring increases 
with its volume of lending. Consequently, as banks 

FIGURE 1: US COMMERCIAL BANKS’ PRIVATE SECTOR LOAN ALLOCATIONS
[2012 DATA THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30]
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expand their lending, the additional expenses entailed 
to screen and monitor loans tend to increase more than 
proportionately. This fact automatically tends to limit 
the optimal scale of lending by cautious banks. 

Of course, owners and managers at some banks may 
alternatively choose to direct spending to other pur-
poses, including more plush office environments, exec-
utive perks, or other expenses unrelated to reducing 
risks of loan losses. Expanding lending generates addi-
tional revenues to banks to fund such expenses. Con-
sequently, these banks are likely to be key contributors 
to any aggregate overlending problem that might exist.

Proposals to rein in potential bank overlending call for 
imposition of a single per-dollar tax rate on all bank 
credit extensions. Such a tax would fall equally on both 
banks that make good-faith efforts to contain expo-
sures to loan losses and banks that do not. Of course, a 
uniform tax on loans would give both groups of banks 
incentives to reduce their lending, consistent with a pol-
icy aim to prevent the overlending that drives up risks of 
loan losses. Banks that devote few resources to averting 
loan losses would cut back on credit extensions, thereby 
reducing their loss exposures as intended.

Now consider the effects of applying a uniform tax rate 
to the lending of banks that already allocate substantial 
resources to limiting loan-loss exposures. The imme-
diate effect of the imposition of the tax on these banks 
would be to further ratchet up their expenses at ini-
tial scales of lending operations. There are two ways 
that these banks could opt to respond to the resulting 
higher lending costs. One reaction would be to extend 
less credit. On the one hand, this response is consistent 
with the aim of the tax, because pressures on the size of 
the pool of creditworthy borrowers are reduced when 
these loss-limiting banks cut back on their lending. On 
the other hand, lending cuts by these banks would yield 
fewer loans that otherwise would have been screened 
and monitored. Thus, higher-quality, lower-risk loans 
that these loss-limiting banks previously would have 
extended would not be made once the tax is imposed. 
Furthermore, banks that screen and monitor already 
incur the additional costs of performing these func-
tions, which other banks choose not to incur, so impos-
ing a tax expands the screening and monitoring banks’ 
already proportionately greater burden. Hence, these 
banks would more heavily feel the weight of the tax, 

which would induce them to reduce their lending by a 
proportionately larger amount than banks that made no 
special effort to limit loan losses. 

An alternative response to the tax by the loss-limit-
ing banks would be to cut back on expenses on exist-
ing lending operations in an effort to keep the scale of 
those operations close to the pre-tax level. Toward this 
end, the loss-limiting banks could reduce their employ-
ment of labor and capital resources, including some of 
the resources previously devoted to the screening and 
monitoring activities that normally would help con-
strain their exposures to loan losses. These banks would 
have considerable incentive to contemplate responding 
in this way, given the resulting more-than-proportion-
ate cost reductions that would help offset their new tax 
expense. Post-tax cutbacks in loss-limiting expenses 
by banks that previously had employed just-sufficient 
quantities of resources to the task of reducing risk 
exposures would cause them to become more heavily 
exposed to loan losses. They essentially would become 
more like the other banks that already had done little to 
avert risks of loan losses.

To sum up, one consequence of imposing a tax on bank 
lending would be an aggregate lending reduction con-
sistent with the goal of combatting a perceived over-
lending problem; however, another consequence would 
be an altered composition of aggregate lending. Banks 
that incur costs required to limit loan losses may reduce 
their lending by a larger amount than banks that forgo 
such expenses, so a smaller share of total post-tax lend-
ing would be screened and monitored as effectively as 
before imposition of the tax. In addition, some loss-
limiting banks would engage in risk-reducing efforts 
less intensively than they did before the tax, and at 
least a few likely would opt to halt such efforts. On net, 
imposing the tax would simultaneously yield fewer 
total loans to be exposed to loan losses while having the 
unintended effect of leaving fewer loans remaining that 
banks would try to shield from such losses.

What about the effects of taxes intended to induce 
reductions in potentially excessive interbank borrow-
ings? Realistically, a bank’s asset and liability allocations 
are interdependent; when the bank alters its liabilities, it 
usually reconfigures its assets. Imposing a tax on inter-
bank borrowings thereby would give banks an incentive 
not only to contract those borrowings but also to reduce 
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their lending—resulting in effects on aggregate credit 
quality analogous to those discussed above in regard to 
a tax on lending. In addition, banks would alter the post-
tax composition of their liabilities in ways that conceiv-
ably could be riskier on net. Consider, for instance a tax 
on borrowing in wholesale interbank markets, much 
like a tax recently imposed on many banks in the United 
Kingdom. In the face of such a tax, banks could seek to 
cut overall expenses on other liabilities by substituting 
lower-expense subordinated debts for higher-expense 
equity capital that arguably provides a stronger buffer 
against losses to taxpayers in the event of a bank failure.

BETTER WAYS TO LIMIT “OVERLENDING” AND 
“EXCESSIVE” INTERBANK BORROWING

As is often the case with most actual and proposed 
government interventions, the imposition of bank taxes 
would have unintended effects. These effects generally 
would work against the overarching aim of increasing 
the safety and soundness of the US banking system. 

While the upsurge in real-estate lending between 1982 
and 2006 depicted in Figure 1 arguably involved some 
“excessive” interbank borrowings to support “overlend-
ing” in this bank loan category, it is far more likely that 
factors other than naturally occurring banking external-
ities caused these outcomes. These other factors include 
explicit and implicit government subsidies to borrowers 
and lenders in real-estate loan markets, capital regu-
lations that provided banks with strong incentives to 
originate real-estate loans to sell to taxpayer-subsidized 
government-sponsored entities, and a Federal Reserve 
policy stance that artificially depresses the price of 
credit. Removing these contributors to “overlending” 
and “excessive” interbank borrowings would be much 
more effective at improving overall bank safety and 
soundness than imposing bank taxes, which could actu-
ally undermine this overarching public policy goal.
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